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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS

1. 8” P.V.C. WATER PIPE, AWWA C-900, DR 18, CLASS 235, ALL DEPTHS, 

RESTRAINED JOINTS WHERE NECESSARY, AND ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  99 $45.25 $4,479.75 $59.00 $5,841.00 $32.00 $3,168.00 $30.00 $2,970.00

2. 12" P.V.C. WATER PIPE, AWWA C-900, DR 18, CLASS 235, ALL DEPTHS, 

RESTRAINED JOINTS WHERE NECESSARY, AND ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  2468 $63.65 $157,088.20 $51.00 $125,868.00 $52.00 $128,336.00 $53.00 $130,804.00

3. FIRE HYDRANT UNIT, ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL APPURTENANCES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  8 $6,717.85 $53,742.80 $6,700.00 $53,600.00 $6,500.00 $52,000.00 $6,995.00 $55,960.00

4. BLUE DEAD END FIRE HYDRANT UNIT, ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $7,123.60 $14,247.20 $5,750.00 $11,500.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $6,834.00 $13,668.00

5. REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING BLUE DEAD END FIRE HYDRANT UNIT 

AND CONNECT PROPOSED WATERLINE TO EXISTING WATERLINE, ALL 

DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $173.90 $347.80 $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $378.00 $756.00

6. 8” RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVE WITH BOX, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,322.00 $2,322.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,861.00 $1,861.00

7. 12” RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVE WITH BOX, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  6 $4,484.00 $26,904.00 $3,700.00 $22,200.00 $3,300.00 $19,800.00 $3,498.00 $20,988.00

8. DUCTILE IRON WATERLINE FITTINGS, COMPLETE IN PLACE TON 0.61 $100.00 $61.00 $6,900.00 $4,209.00 $100.00 $61.00 $6,376.00 $3,889.36

9. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  2567 $2.00 $5,134.00 $2.00 $5,134.00 $2.00 $5,134.00 $2.00 $5,134.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS $264,326.75 $232,752.00 $223,299.00 $236,030.36

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS - COMMERCIAL

1. 8” P.V.C. WATER PIPE, AWWA C-900, DR 18, CLASS 235, ALL DEPTHS, 

RESTRAINED JOINTS WHERE NECESSARY, AND ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  30 $45.25 $1,357.50 $62.00 $1,860.00 $32.00 $960.00 $43.00 $1,290.00

2. 12" P.V.C. WATER PIPE, AWWA C-900, DR 18, CLASS 235, ALL DEPTHS, 

RESTRAINED JOINTS WHERE NECESSARY, AND ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  443 $63.65 $28,196.95 $52.00 $23,036.00 $52.00 $23,036.00 $57.00 $25,251.00

3. BLUE DEAD END FIRE HYDRANT UNIT, ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $7,123.60 $14,247.20 $5,750.00 $11,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,834.00 $13,668.00

4. 8” RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVE WITH BOX, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,322.00 $2,322.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,861.00 $1,861.00

5. 12” RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVE WITH BOX, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $4,484.00 $8,968.00 $3,700.00 $7,400.00 $3,300.00 $6,600.00 $3,498.00 $6,996.00

6. DUCTILE IRON WATERLINE FITTINGS, COMPLETE IN PLACE TON 0.18 $100.00 $18.00 $600.00 $108.00 $100.00 $18.00 $16,643.00 $2,995.74

7. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  473 $2.00 $946.00 $2.00 $946.00 $2.00 $946.00 $2.00 $946.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $56,055.65 $46,950.00 $38,360.00 $53,007.74

BASE BID SAMARA WAY WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS 

1. 12" P.V.C. WATER PIPE, AWWA C-900, DR 18, CLASS 235, ALL DEPTHS, 

RESTRAINED JOINTS WHERE NECESSARY, AND ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  376 $63.65 $23,932.40 $53.00 $19,928.00 $52.00 $19,552.00 $57.00 $21,432.00

2. FIRE HYDRANT UNIT, ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL APPURTENANCES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $6,717.85 $6,717.85 $6,850.00 $6,850.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,529.00 $6,529.00

3. REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING BLUE DEAD END FIRE HYDRANT UNIT 

AND CONNECT PROPOSED WATERLINE TO EXISTING WATERLINE, ALL 

DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $173.90 $173.90 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,132.00 $1,132.00

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

4. 12” RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVE WITH BOX, INCLUDING ALL 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $4,484.00 $4,484.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $3,489.00 $3,489.00

5. DUCTILE IRON WATERLINE FITTINGS, COMPLETE IN PLACE TON 0.23 $100.00 $23.00 $4,900.00 $1,127.00 $100.00 $23.00 $4,647.00 $1,068.81

6. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  376 $2.00 $752.00 $2.00 $752.00 $2.00 $752.00 $2.00 $752.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID SAMARA WAY WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS $36,083.15 $33,657.00 $30,627.00 $34,402.81

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI SANITARY SEWER TRUNK ITEMS

1. (M.H. S-12 - M.H. S-13) 8” P.V.C. SEWER PIPE (GREEN), ASTM D-3034, SDR 

26, 16'-20’ DEPTH, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  149 $62.10 $9,252.90 $45.00 $6,705.00 $45.00 $6,705.00 $80.00 $11,920.00

2. (M.H. S-13 - M.H. S-14) 8” P.V.C. SEWER PIPE (GREEN), ASTM D-3034, SDR 

26, 16'-20’ DEPTH, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  269 $62.10 $16,704.90 $45.00 $12,105.00 $45.00 $12,105.00 $80.00 $21,520.00

3. (M.H. S-14 - M.H. S-15) 8” P.V.C. SEWER PIPE (GREEN), ASTM D-3034, SDR 

26, 20'-24’ DEPTH, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  256 $62.10 $15,897.60 $60.00 $15,360.00 $60.00 $15,360.00 $100.00 $25,600.00

4. (M.H. S-15 - M.H. S-16) 8” P.V.C. SEWER PIPE (GREEN), ASTM D-3034, SDR 

26, 20’-24' DEPTH, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  302 $62.10 $18,754.20 $60.00 $18,120.00 $60.00 $18,120.00 $100.00 $30,200.00

5. (M.H. S-16 - M.H. S-21) 8” P.V.C. SEWER PIPE (GREEN), ASTM D-3034, SDR 

26, 20’-24' DEPTH, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  240 $62.10 $14,904.00 $60.00 $14,400.00 $60.00 $14,400.00 $100.00 $24,000.00

6. (M.H. S-12) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,109.00 $4,109.00

7. (M.H. S-13) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,109.00 $4,109.00

8. (M.H. S-14) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,217.00 $4,217.00

9. (M.H. S-15) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,217.00 $4,217.00

10. (M.H. S-16) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,217.00 $4,217.00

11. (M.H. S-21) STANDARD SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE FOR 6” – 24” SANITARY 

SEWER PIPES, (0’-8’ DEPTH), INCLUDING THANE COATING, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER

EA  1 $3,941.45 $3,941.45 $3,520.00 $3,520.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,217.00 $4,217.00

12. CORE INTO EXIST. M.H. S-21 AND CONNECT PROPOSED SANITARY SEWER 

LINE, ALL SIZES, ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER

EA  1 $2,782.20 $2,782.20 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,683.00 $2,683.00

13. (M.H. S-12) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE

VF  9.03 $275.00 $2,483.25 $260.00 $2,347.80 $300.00 $2,709.00 $243.00 $2,194.29

14. (M.H. S-13) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE

VF  9.43 $275.00 $2,593.25 $260.00 $2,451.80 $300.00 $2,829.00 $243.00 $2,291.49

15. (M.H. S-14) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  10.29 $275.00 $2,829.75 $260.00 $2,675.40 $300.00 $3,087.00 $243.00 $2,500.47

16. (M.H. S-15) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE

VF  12.17 $275.00 $3,346.75 $260.00 $3,164.20 $300.00 $3,651.00 $243.00 $2,957.31

17. (M.H. S-16) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE

VF  13.24 $275.00 $3,641.00 $260.00 $3,442.40 $300.00 $3,972.00 $243.00 $3,217.32

18. (M.H. S-21) EXTRA DEPTH OF SANITARY SEWER MANHOLES (OVER 8’ 

DEPTH), COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER

VF  14.99 $275.00 $4,122.25 $260.00 $3,897.40 $300.00 $4,497.00 $243.00 $3,642.57
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

19. (M.H. S-12) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

20. (M.H. S-13) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

21. (M.H. S-14) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

22. (M.H. S-15) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

23. (M.H. S-16) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

24. (M.H. S-21) FINAL ADJUSTMENTS TO SANITARY MANHOLES, INCLUDING 

EXISTING MANHOLES, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

25. (M.H. S-12 - M.H. S-13) DEWATERING PER LF OF PIPE (NO SEPARATE PAY 

FOR DOUBLE ROW IF NEEDED), ALL DEPTHS, (THIS IS AN ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER), 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  75 $20.00 $1,500.00 $20.00 $1,500.00 $20.00 $1,500.00 $20.00 $1,500.00

26. (M.H. S-13 - M.H. S-14) DEWATERING PER LF OF PIPE (NO SEPARATE PAY 

FOR DOUBLE ROW IF NEEDED), ALL DEPTHS, (THIS IS AN ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER), 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  135 $20.00 $2,700.00 $20.00 $2,700.00 $20.00 $2,700.00 $20.00 $2,700.00

27. (M.H. S-14 - M.H. S-15) DEWATERING PER LF OF PIPE (NO SEPARATE PAY 

FOR DOUBLE ROW IF NEEDED), ALL DEPTHS, (THIS IS AN ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER), 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  128 $20.00 $2,560.00 $20.00 $2,560.00 $20.00 $2,560.00 $20.00 $2,560.00

28. (M.H. S-15 - M.H. S-16) DEWATERING PER LF OF PIPE (NO SEPARATE PAY 

FOR DOUBLE ROW IF NEEDED), ALL DEPTHS, (THIS IS AN ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER), 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  151 $20.00 $3,020.00 $20.00 $3,020.00 $20.00 $3,020.00 $20.00 $3,020.00

29. (M.H. S-16 - M.H. S-21) DEWATERING PER LF OF PIPE (NO SEPARATE PAY 

FOR DOUBLE ROW IF NEEDED), ALL DEPTHS, (THIS IS AN ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER), 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  120 $20.00 $2,400.00 $20.00 $2,400.00 $20.00 $2,400.00 $20.00 $2,400.00

30. (M.H. S-12 - M.H. S-13) T.V. INSPECTION OF SANITARY SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  149 $3.00 $447.00 $3.00 $447.00 $3.00 $447.00 $3.00 $447.00

31. (M.H. S-13 - M.H. S-14) T.V. INSPECTION OF SANITARY SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  269 $3.00 $807.00 $3.00 $807.00 $3.00 $807.00 $3.00 $807.00

32. (M.H. S-14 - M.H. S-15) T.V. INSPECTION OF SANITARY SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  256 $3.00 $768.00 $3.00 $768.00 $3.00 $768.00 $3.00 $768.00

33. (M.H. S-15 - M.H. S-16) T.V. INSPECTION OF SANITARY SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  302 $3.00 $906.00 $3.00 $906.00 $3.00 $906.00 $3.00 $906.00

34. (M.H. S-16 - M.H. S-21) T.V. INSPECTION OF SANITARY SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  240 $3.00 $720.00 $3.00 $720.00 $3.00 $720.00 $3.00 $720.00

35. (M.H. S-12 - M.H. S-13) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  149 $2.00 $298.00 $2.00 $298.00 $2.00 $298.00 $2.00 $298.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

36. (M.H. S-13 - M.H. S-14) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  269 $2.00 $538.00 $2.00 $538.00 $2.00 $538.00 $2.00 $538.00

37. (M.H. S-14 - M.H. S-15) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  256 $2.00 $512.00 $2.00 $512.00 $2.00 $512.00 $2.00 $512.00

38. (M.H. S-15 - M.H. S-16) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  302 $2.00 $604.00 $2.00 $604.00 $2.00 $604.00 $2.00 $604.00

39. (M.H. S-16 - M.H. S-21) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  240 $2.00 $480.00 $2.00 $480.00 $2.00 $480.00 $2.00 $480.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI SANITARY SEWER TRUNK ITEMS $139,226.75 $125,505.00 $128,301.00 $176,396.45

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS 

1. 24” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER 

GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  974 $90.75 $88,390.50 $85.00 $82,790.00 $74.00 $72,076.00 $82.00 $79,868.00

2. STAGE I – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) ALL 

DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  13 $2,043.20 $26,561.60 $1,150.00 $14,950.00 $1,300.00 $16,900.00 $1,675.00 $21,775.00

3. STAGE II – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) 

ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  13 $2,411.25 $31,346.25 $2,350.00 $30,550.00 $2,200.00 $28,600.00 $1,779.00 $23,127.00

4. TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, ALL DEPTHS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $2,376.45 $4,752.90 $2,900.00 $5,800.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,637.00 $5,274.00

5. REINFORCED CONCRETE TYPE “A” INLET, ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE EA  2 $3,332.85 $6,665.70 $1,750.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $2,194.00 $4,388.00

6. FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, JUNCTION 

BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  4 $1.00 $4.00 $1.00 $4.00 $1.00 $4.00 $54.00 $216.00

7. CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED AREAS (PER 

DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

8. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  974 $2.00 $1,948.00 $2.00 $1,948.00 $2.00 $1,948.00 $2.00 $1,948.00

9. T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE USED ONLY AT THE 

DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  974 $3.00 $2,922.00 $3.00 $2,922.00 $3.00 $2,922.00 $3.00 $2,922.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS $162,909.75 $142,964.00 $133,150.00 $140,253.00

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS - COMMERCIAL

1. 24” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER 

GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  72 $90.75 $6,534.00 $85.00 $6,120.00 $74.00 $5,328.00 $92.00 $6,624.00

2. STAGE I – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) ALL 

DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  2 $2,043.20 $4,086.40 $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $1,675.00 $3,350.00

3. STAGE II – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) 

ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  2 $2,411.25 $4,822.50 $2,350.00 $4,700.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $1,770.00 $3,540.00

4. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  72 $2.00 $144.00 $2.00 $144.00 $2.00 $144.00 $2.00 $144.00

5. T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE USED ONLY AT THE 

DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  72 $3.00 $216.00 $3.00 $216.00 $3.00 $216.00 $3.00 $216.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $15,802.90 $13,480.00 $12,688.00 $13,874.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY TRUNK ITEMS

1. (M.H. D-1A - M.H. D-2A) 24” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  438 $90.75 $39,748.50 $80.00 $35,040.00 $74.00 $32,412.00 $76.00 $33,288.00

2. (M.H. D-2A - M.H. D-3A) 30” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  326 $107.40 $35,012.40 $109.00 $35,534.00 $92.00 $29,992.00 $94.00 $30,644.00

3. (M.H. D-3A - M.H. D-4A) 36” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  410 $148.70 $60,967.00 $153.00 $62,730.00 $130.00 $53,300.00 $776.00 $318,160.00

4. (M.H. D-4A - M.H. D-5A) 36” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  96 $148.70 $14,275.20 $147.00 $14,112.00 $130.00 $12,480.00 $127.00 $12,192.00

5. (M.H. D-5A - M.H. D-6A) 36” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  132 $148.70 $19,628.40 $150.00 $19,800.00 $130.00 $17,160.00 $127.00 $16,764.00

6. (M.H. D-6A - M.H. D-7A) 42” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, 

ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  449 $194.55 $87,352.95 $194.00 $87,106.00 $170.00 $76,330.00 $172.00 $77,228.00

7. (M.H. D-7A - TYPE H-2 INLET #702) 42” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, 

CLASS III, ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  36 $194.55 $7,003.80 $215.00 $7,740.00 $170.00 $6,120.00 $172.00 $6,192.00

8. (TYPE H-2 INLET #702 - OUTFALL A) 48” H.D.P.E. STORM SEWER, AASHTO M-

294, ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER GASKET JOINTS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  118 $124.65 $14,708.70 $143.00 $16,874.00 $145.00 $17,110.00 $143.00 $16,874.00

9. (M.H. D-1A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

10. (M.H. D-2A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

11. (M.H. D-3A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

12. (M.H. D-4A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

13. (M.H. D-5A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

14. (M.H. D-6A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, 

ALL DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

15. (M.H. D-7A) TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 48” STORM SEWERS AND LARGER, ALL 

DEPTHS, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $3,130.00 $3,130.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,220.00 $3,220.00

16. (TYPE H-2 INLET #702) STAGE I – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED 

CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $7,871.60 $7,871.60 $4,550.00 $4,550.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $6,625.00 $6,625.00

17. (TYPE H-2 INLET #702) STAGE II – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED 

CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,411.25 $2,411.25 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,256.00 $2,256.00

18. (M.H. D-1A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

19. (M.H. D-2A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

20. (M.H. D-3A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

21. (M.H. D-4A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

22. (M.H. D-5A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

23. (M.H. D-6A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

24. (M.H. D-7A) FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, 

JUNCTION BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

25. (M.H. D-1A) CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED 

AREAS (PER DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

26. (M.H. D-2A) CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED 

AREAS (PER DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

27. (M.H. D-4A) CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED 

AREAS (PER DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

28. (M.H. D-5A) CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED 

AREAS (PER DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

29. (M.H. D-6A) CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED 

AREAS (PER DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

30. 18” RIP RAP, COMPLETE IN PLACE SY  53 $115.95 $6,145.35 $120.00 $6,360.00 $105.00 $5,565.00 $131.00 $6,943.00

31. 5" REINFORCED CONCRETE SLOPE PAVING WITH 2' MINIMUM TOE WALLS 

ALL AROUND, 2' CLAY LINER BELOW ALL SLOPE PAVING, AND EXPANSION 

JOINTS, PER DETAIL, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  44 $173.90 $7,651.60 $115.00 $5,060.00 $130.00 $5,720.00 $162.00 $7,128.00

32. CONSTRUCTION AND REMOVAL OF TEMPORARY COFFER DAM FOR THE 

CONSTRUCTION OF STORM SEWER OUTFALL, INCLUDES A MINIMUM OF 

90% TURF REESTABLISHMENT VIA HYDROMULCH SEEDING FOLLOWING 

COFFER DAM REMOVAL, DEWATERING AND ALL APPURTENANCES, ALL 

SIZES, ALL DEPTHS, (AS DIRECTED BY ENGINEER, PER GEOTECHNICAL 

RECOMMENDATION), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $11,592.50 $11,592.50 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $9,186.00 $9,186.00

33. (M.H. D-1A - M.H. D-2A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  438 $2.00 $876.00 $2.00 $876.00 $2.00 $876.00 $2.00 $876.00

34. (M.H. D-2A - M.H. D-3A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  326 $2.00 $652.00 $2.00 $652.00 $2.00 $652.00 $2.00 $652.00

35. (M.H. D-3A - M.H. D-4A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  410 $2.00 $820.00 $2.00 $820.00 $2.00 $820.00 $2.00 $820.00

36. (M.H. D-4A - M.H. D-5A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  96 $2.00 $192.00 $2.00 $192.00 $2.00 $192.00 $2.00 $192.00

37. (M.H. D-5A - M.H. D-6A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  132 $2.00 $264.00 $2.00 $264.00 $2.00 $264.00 $2.00 $264.00

38. (M.H. D-6A - M.H. D-7A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  449 $2.00 $898.00 $2.00 $898.00 $2.00 $898.00 $2.00 $898.00

39. (M.H. D-7A - TYPE H-2 INLET #702) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, 

ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  36 $2.00 $72.00 $2.00 $72.00 $2.00 $72.00 $2.00 $72.00

40. (TYPE H-2 INLET #702 - OUTFALL A) TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, 

ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  118 $2.00 $236.00 $2.00 $236.00 $2.00 $236.00 $2.00 $236.00

41. (M.H. D-1A - M.H. D-2A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  438 $3.00 $1,314.00 $3.00 $1,314.00 $3.00 $1,314.00 $3.00 $1,314.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

42. (M.H. D-2A - M.H. D-3A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  326 $3.00 $978.00 $3.00 $978.00 $3.00 $978.00 $3.00 $978.00

43. (M.H. D-3A - M.H. D-4A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  410 $3.00 $1,230.00 $3.00 $1,230.00 $3.00 $1,230.00 $3.00 $1,230.00

44. (M.H. D-4A - M.H. D-5A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  96 $3.00 $288.00 $3.00 $288.00 $3.00 $288.00 $3.00 $288.00

45. (M.H. D-5A - M.H. D-6A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  132 $3.00 $396.00 $3.00 $396.00 $3.00 $396.00 $3.00 $396.00

46. (M.H. D-6A - M.H. D-7A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE 

USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  449 $3.00 $1,347.00 $3.00 $1,347.00 $3.00 $1,347.00 $3.00 $1,347.00

47. (M.H. D-7A - TYPE H-2 INLET #702) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER 

LINES, TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE 

IN PLACE

LF  36 $3.00 $108.00 $3.00 $108.00 $3.00 $108.00 $3.00 $108.00

48. (TYPE H-2 INLET #702 - OUTFALL A) T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER 

LINES, TO BE USED ONLY AT THE DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE 

IN PLACE

LF  118 $3.00 $354.00 $3.00 $354.00 $3.00 $354.00 $3.00 $354.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY TRUNK ITEMS $343,383.95 $334,988.00 $304,721.00 $580,098.00

BASE BID SAMARA WAY DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS

1. 24” R.C.P. STORM SEWER, ASTM C-76, CLASS III, ALL DEPTHS, WITH RUBBER 

GASKET JOINTS, INCLUDING BEDDING AND BACKFILL, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  144 $86.35 $12,434.40 $80.00 $11,520.00 $74.00 $10,656.00 $82.00 $11,808.00

2. STAGE I – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) ALL 

DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  2 $2,043.20 $4,086.40 $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $1,675.00 $3,350.00

3. STAGE II – STANDARD 5’ PRECAST REINFORCED CONCRETE INLET (“H-2”) 

ALL DEPTHS, INCLUDING ALL NECESSARY APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  2 $2,411.25 $4,822.50 $2,350.00 $4,700.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $1,770.00 $3,540.00

4. TYPE “C” MANHOLE FOR 42” STORM SEWERS AND SMALLER, ALL DEPTHS, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $2,376.45 $2,376.45 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,561.00 $2,561.00

5. FINAL ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING AND PROPOSED MANHOLES, JUNCTION 

BOXES, AND INLET THROAT AND OPENING ELEVATIONS, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $54.00 $54.00

6. CONCRETE BLOCKOUT FOR PROPOSED MANHOLES IN PAVED AREAS (PER 

DETAIL), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $318.80 $318.80 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $735.00 $735.00

7. TRENCH SAFETY SYSTEM, ALL DEPTHS, ALL SIZES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  144 $2.00 $288.00 $2.00 $288.00 $2.00 $288.00 $2.20 $316.80

8. T.V. INSPECTION OF STORM SEWER LINES, TO BE USED ONLY AT THE 

DIRECTION OF THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  144 $3.00 $432.00 $3.00 $432.00 $3.00 $432.00 $3.30 $475.20

SUBTOTAL BASE BID SAMARA WAY DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS $24,759.55 $22,641.00 $22,377.00 $22,840.00

BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS WS&D ITEMS

1. INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REMOVAL OF STABILIZED 

CONSTRUCTION EXIT, SWMHCA SPECIFICATION NO. 4711, INCLUDES 

INSTALLATION AND REMOVAL (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

2. METHOD “A” CONSTRUCTION STAKING BY THE CONTRACTOR FOR WATER, 

SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LS  1 $1,159.25 $1,159.25 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,477.00 $3,477.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

3. CITY OF LEAGUE CITY INSPECTOR OVERTIME CHARGE, TO BE APPROVED BY 

THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

HR  10 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00

4. STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN COMPLIANCE, INCLUDING 

CONTRACTOR BOOKLET, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LS  1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00

5. OVER EXCAVATION OF UNSUITABLE MATERIAL FOR FILL PLACEMENT, AS 

DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  3000 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6,000.00

6. WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND STORM SEWER UTILITY SPOILS TO BE USED 

AS FILL PER THE GRADING PLAN WITHIN SECTION, INCLUDES EXCAVATION, 

HAULING AND COMPACTION TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY WITH 

MAXIMUM 8” LIFTS, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  5486 $2.90 $15,909.40 $1.00 $5,486.00 $5.75 $31,544.50 $4.00 $21,944.00

7. MISCELLANEOUS DRAINAGE SWALES, V-BOTTOM, GRADED TO DRAIN, 

INCLUDES HYDROMULCH SEEDING AND WATERING, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  1500 $3.00 $4,500.00 $3.00 $4,500.00 $3.00 $4,500.00 $3.00 $4,500.00

8. REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING BACK SLOPE INTERCEPTOR, INCLUDING 

24" H.D.P.E. STORM SEWER PIPE, SLOPE PAVING, RIP-RAP, AND ALL OTHER 

APPURTENANCES, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1,159.25 $1,159.25 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS WS&D ITEMS $31,227.90 $29,986.00 $53,021.50 $53,544.00

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS

1. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, COMPLETE IN PLACE SY  16283 $58.05 $945,228.15 $62.00 $1,009,546.00 $62.00 $1,009,546.00 $65.00 $1,058,395.00

2. 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION, INCLUDES COMPACTION 

TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  18453 $2.55 $47,055.15 $5.00 $92,265.00 $6.00 $110,718.00 $4.50 $83,038.50

3. 10% LIME BY WEIGHT, 70 LBS/SY FOR SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE PAID 

ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED QUANTITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 646 $338.25 $218,509.50 $330.00 $213,180.00 $360.00 $232,560.00 $360.00 $232,560.00

4. 6” REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, AS INDICATED ON PLANS, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

LF  9625 $3.75 $36,093.75 $4.00 $38,500.00 $4.35 $41,868.75 $4.00 $38,500.00

5. ADA RAMPS (TYPE 4), INCLUDING TRUNCATED DOME BRICKS TO BE ADA 

RED, INCLUDES REMOVAL OF EXISTING CURB IF REQUIRED AND ALL OTHER 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  12 $1,281.25 $15,375.00 $1,670.00 $20,040.00 $1,450.00 $17,400.00 $1,800.00 $21,600.00

6. 4” SQUARE DOUBLE REFLECTORIZED BLUE TRAFFIC BUTTONS FOR FIRE 

HYDRANT LOCATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  8 $10.25 $82.00 $15.00 $120.00 $20.00 $160.00 $20.00 $160.00

7. 24” SOD STRIPING ALONG BACK OF CURB, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  9625 $2.00 $19,250.00 $2.00 $19,250.00 $2.00 $19,250.00 $2.00 $19,250.00

8. REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF TYPE III BARRICADE, ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  3 $1.00 $3.00 $1.00 $3.00 $0.01 $0.03 $180.00 $540.00

9. REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVING HEADER, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  70 $10.25 $717.50 $25.00 $1,750.00 $15.00 $1,050.00 $21.00 $1,470.00

10. INSTALLATION OF TYPE III BARRICADE, ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $1,178.75 $2,357.50 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,350.00 $2,700.00 $1,260.00 $2,520.00

11. 6" P.V.C. SCHEDULE 40 IRRIGATION SLEEVES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  295 $28.70 $8,466.50 $23.00 $6,785.00 $25.00 $7,375.00 $40.00 $11,800.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $1,293,138.05 $1,403,839.00 $1,442,627.78 $1,469,833.50

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL

1. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, COMPLETE IN PLACE SY  3007 $58.05 $174,556.35 $62.00 $186,434.00 $62.00 $186,434.00 $65.00 $195,455.00

2. 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION, INCLUDES COMPACTION 

TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  3395 $2.55 $8,657.25 $5.00 $16,975.00 $6.00 $20,370.00 $4.50 $15,277.50

Page 9 of 13

FRN F-1386

LJA Engineering, Inc.

O:\LAND\0386\3119C\6.5.26_WSDP Samara Evin Ph VI

LJA Engineering, In
c



BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

3. 10% LIME BY WEIGHT, 70 LBS/SY FOR SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE PAID 

ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED QUANTITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 119 $338.25 $40,251.75 $330.00 $39,270.00 $360.00 $42,840.00 $360.00 $42,840.00

4. 6” REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, AS INDICATED ON PLANS, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

LF  1663 $3.60 $5,986.80 $4.00 $6,652.00 $4.35 $7,234.05 $4.00 $6,652.00

5. ADA RAMPS (TYPE 4), INCLUDING TRUNCATED DOME BRICKS TO BE ADA 

RED, INCLUDES REMOVAL OF EXISTING CURB IF REQUIRED AND ALL OTHER 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $1,281.25 $2,562.50 $1,670.00 $3,340.00 $1,450.00 $2,900.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00

6. 24” SOD STRIPING ALONG BACK OF CURB, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  1663 $2.00 $3,326.00 $2.00 $3,326.00 $2.00 $3,326.00 $2.00 $3,326.00

7. INSTALLATION OF TYPE III BARRICADE, ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  3 $1,178.75 $3,536.25 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $1,350.00 $4,050.00 $1,260.00 $3,780.00

8. REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVING HEADER, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  80 $10.25 $820.00 $25.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $1,200.00 $21.00 $1,680.00

9. 6" P.V.C. SCHEDULE 40 IRRIGATION SLEEVES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  58 $28.70 $1,664.60 $40.00 $2,320.00 $25.00 $1,450.00 $40.00 $2,320.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $241,361.50 $263,917.00 $269,804.05 $274,930.50

BASE BID SAMARA WAY PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS

1. 7” REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, COMPLETE IN PLACE SY  1237 $53.80 $66,550.60 $56.00 $69,272.00 $59.50 $73,601.50 $58.50 $72,364.50

2. 7” REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT TO BE USED FOR PARKING STALL 

AREA, AS DIRECTED BY ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  351 $53.80 $18,883.80 $66.00 $23,166.00 $59.50 $20,884.50 $60.00 $21,060.00

3. 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION, INCLUDES COMPACTION 

TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  1365 $2.55 $3,480.75 $5.00 $6,825.00 $6.00 $8,190.00 $4.50 $6,142.50

4. 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION TO BE USED FOR PARKING 

STALL AREA, INCLUDES COMPACTION TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR 

DENSITY, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  426 $2.55 $1,086.30 $5.00 $2,130.00 $6.00 $2,556.00 $4.50 $1,917.00

5. 10% LIME BY WEIGHT, 70LB/SY FOR SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE PAID 

ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED QUANTITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 48 $338.25 $16,236.00 $330.00 $15,840.00 $360.00 $17,280.00 $360.00 $17,280.00

6. 10% LIME BY WEIGHT TO BE USED FOR PARKING STALL AREA, 70LB/SY FOR 

SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE PAID ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED 

QUANTITY, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 15 $338.25 $5,073.75 $330.00 $4,950.00 $360.00 $5,400.00 $360.00 $5,400.00

7. 6” REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, AS INDICATED ON PLANS, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

LF  528 $3.60 $1,900.80 $4.00 $2,112.00 $4.35 $2,296.80 $4.00 $2,112.00

8. ADA RAMPS (TYPE 4), INCLUDING TRUNCATED DOME BRICKS TO BE ADA 

RED, INCLUDES REMOVAL OF EXISTING CURB IF REQUIRED AND ALL OTHER 

APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  2 $1,281.25 $2,562.50 $1,670.00 $3,340.00 $1,450.00 $2,900.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00

9. ADA RAMPS (TYPE 2), INCLUDING TRUNCATED DOME BRICKS TO BE ADA 

RED TO BE USED FOR PARKING STALL AREA, INCLUDES REMOVAL OF 

EXISTING CURB IF REQUIRED AND ALL OTHER APPURTENANCES, COMPLETE 

IN PLACE

LF  2 $1,281.25 $2,562.50 $1,670.00 $3,340.00 $2,550.00 $5,100.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00

10. 4” SQUARE DOUBLE REFLECTORIZED BLUE TRAFFIC BUTTONS FOR FIRE 

HYDRANT LOCATION, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $10.25 $10.25 $15.00 $15.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $20.00

11. 24” SOD STRIPING ALONG BACK OF CURB, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  528 $2.00 $1,056.00 $2.00 $1,056.00 $2.00 $1,056.00 $2.00 $1,056.00

12. REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF TYPE III BARRICADE, ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $0.01 $0.01 $180.00 $180.00

13. 6" P.V.C. SCHEDULE 40 IRRIGATION SLEEVES, COMPLETE IN PLACE LF  46 $28.70 $1,320.20 $48.00 $2,208.00 $25.00 $1,150.00 $40.00 $1,840.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID SAMARA WAY PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $120,724.45 $134,255.00 $140,434.81 $136,572.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS

1. PERMANENT TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, INCLUDING TRAFFIC BUTTONS 

PAVEMENT STRIPING, MARKERS, REFLECTIVE PAINT ON MEDIAN NOSES, 

STOP SIGNS, STREET SIGNS, AND ALL OTHER TRAFFIC SIGNS SHOWN IN 

PLANS, ETC., COMPLETE IN PLACE

LS  1 $15,003.20 $15,003.20 $21,700.00 $21,700.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $24,835.00 $24,835.00

2. MISCELLANEOUS DRAINAGE SWALES, V-BOTTOM, GRADED TO DRAIN, 

INCLUDES HYDROMULCH SEEDING AND WATERING, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  1000 $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00 $3.00 $3,000.00

3. OVER EXCAVATION OF UNSUITABLE MATERIAL FOR FILL PLACEMENT, AS 

DIRECTED BY ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  1500 $2.00 $3,000.00 $2.00 $3,000.00 $2.00 $3,000.00 $2.00 $3,000.00

4. DEMUCK, SCARIFY, AND FILL EXISTING DRAINAGE SWALES, AS NEEDED, AS 

DIRECTED BY ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  6100 $2.00 $12,200.00 $2.00 $12,200.00 $2.00 $12,200.00 $2.00 $12,200.00

5. COMMON ROADWAY EXCAVATION TO BE HAULED, STRIPPED, PLACED, AND 

COMPACTED TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY ON-SITE FOR SITE AND 

ROADWAY FILL, AS DIRECTED BY ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  8114 $2.55 $20,690.70 $3.25 $26,370.50 $5.75 $46,655.50 $4.50 $36,513.00

6. CITY OF LEAGUE CITY INSPECTION FEE, AS DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER, 

COMPLETE IN PLACE

MO  5 $5,500.00 $27,500.00 $5,500.00 $27,500.00 $5,500.00 $27,500.00 $5,500.00 $27,500.00

7. CITY OF LEAGUE CITY INSPECTOR OVERTIME CHARGE, TO BE APPROVED BY 

THE ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

HR  10 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00 $50.00 $500.00

8. AS-BUILT SURVEY OF FILL AREAS (CONTRACTOR’S SURVEYOR MUST 

PROVIDE CERTIFIED TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY, INCLUDING ALL GRADE 

BREAKS, USING ON-GROUNDSHOTS AS A MEANS OF DATA COLLECTION, 

INCLUDES 3D CAD FORMAT BEFORE FINAL PAYMENT IS MADE), COMPLETE 

IN PLACE

LS  1 $7,535.15 $7,535.15 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $16,591.00 $16,591.00

9. INSTALLATION AND REMOVAL UPON COMPLETION OF CONCRETE 

WASHOUT AREA, COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

10. INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE AND REMOVAL OF STABILIZED 

CONSTRUCTION EXIT, SWMHCA SPECIFICATION NO. 4711, INCLUDES 

INSTALLATION AND REMOVAL (TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER), COMPLETE IN PLACE

EA  1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00

11. CEMENT STABILIZED SAND TO BE USED AS BACKFILL FOR EXIST. 66" R.C.P. 

STORM SEWER PIPE CONNECTING POND 4 AND POND 5 UNDER ERVIN 

STREET, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  450 $45.90 $20,655.00 $20.00 $9,000.00 $65.00 $29,250.00 $100.00 $45,000.00

12. EXTRA CEMENT STABILIZED SAND, TO BE USED ONLY AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

CY  1000 $20.00 $20,000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00

13. METHOD "A" CONSTRUCTION STAKING BY THE CONTRACTOR, COMPLETE IN 

PLACE

LS  1 $1,159.25 $1,159.25 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $8,090.00 $8,090.00 $18,725.00 $18,725.00

14. DRAINAGE SWALES, 4:1 SIDE SLOPES, V-BOTTOM, GRADED TO DRAIN, 

INCLUDING HYDROMULCH AND WATERING, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  1246 $6.15 $7,662.90 $3.00 $3,738.00 $5.10 $6,354.60 $4.00 $4,984.00

15. OVERFLOW SWALE, PER GRADING PLAN, 10' BOTTOM WIDTH, INCLUDING 

HYDROMULCH SEEDING, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LF  37 $14.35 $530.95 $30.00 $1,110.00 $25.25 $934.25 $20.00 $740.00

16. STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN COMPLIANCE, INCLUDING 

CONTRACTOR BOOKLET, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LS  1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $9,904.51 $9,904.51 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

17. ADDITIONAL PERMANENT PAVEMENT MARKINGS FOR PARKING STALLS, 

INCLUDING STRIPING, SYMBOLS, LETTERING, AND ALL ASSOCIATED 

MARKINGS FOR PARKING AREA, COMPLETE IN PLACE

LS  1 $2,562.50 $2,562.50 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00

SUBTOTAL BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $144,999.65 $148,318.50 $200,588.86 $222,588.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

ALTERNATE NO. 1 SLIP-FORM PAVING 

1. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CONSTRUCTED USING THE SLIP-

FORM PAVING METHOD IN FULL ACCORDANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE SLIP-

FORM PAVING SPECIFICATIONS, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, IN LIEU OF ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND 

APPURTENANCES ITEM NO. 1

SY  13965 NO BID NO BID $68.00 $949,620.00 $180.00 $2,513,700.00 NO BID NO BID

2. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CONSTRUCTED USING THE SLIP-

FORM PAVING METHOD IN FULL ACCORDANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE SLIP-

FORM PAVING SPECIFICATIONS, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS DIRECTED BY THE 

ENGINEER, IN LIEU OF ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND 

APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL ITEM NO. 1

SY  2499 NO BID NO BID $68.00 $169,932.00 $180.00 $449,820.00 NO BID NO BID

SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE NO. 1 SLIP-FORM PAVING  NO BID $1,119,552.00 $2,963,520.00 NO BID

ALTERNATE NO. 1 ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS

1. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CONSTRUCTED USING 

CONVENTIONAL HAND-PLACEMENT METHODS, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS 

DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER

SY  2318 $65.50 $151,829.00 $63.00 $146,034.00 $62.00 $143,716.00 $65.00 $150,670.00

2. EXTRA 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION, INCLUDES 

COMPACTION TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  2857 $2.90 $8,285.30 $5.00 $14,285.00 $6.00 $17,142.00 $4.50 $12,856.50

3. EXTRA 10% LIME BY WEIGHT, 70 LBS/SY FOR SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE 

PAID ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED QUANTITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 100 $382.55 $38,255.00 $330.00 $33,000.00 $360.00 $36,000.00 $360.00 $36,000.00

SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE NO. 1 ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $198,369.30 $193,319.00 $196,858.00 $199,526.50

ALTERNATE NO. 1 ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL

1. 8" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, CONSTRUCTED USING 

CONVENTIONAL HAND-PLACEMENT METHODS, COMPLETE IN PLACE, AS 

DIRECTED BY THE ENGINEER

SY  508 $65.50 $33,274.00 $66.00 $33,528.00 $62.00 $31,496.00 $65.00 $33,020.00

2. EXTRA 8” LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE MANIPULATION, INCLUDES 

COMPACTION TO 95% STANDARD PROCTOR DENSITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

SY  500 $2.90 $1,450.00 $5.00 $2,500.00 $6.00 $3,000.00 $4.50 $2,250.00

3. EXTRA 10% LIME BY WEIGHT, 70 LBS/SY FOR SUBGRADE, QUANTITY TO BE 

PAID ONLY FOR FIELD LAB RECOMMENDED QUANTITY, COMPLETE IN PLACE

TON 18 $382.55 $6,885.90 $330.00 $5,940.00 $360.00 $6,480.00 $3,600.00 $64,800.00

SUBTOTAL ALTERNATE NO. 1 ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $41,609.90 $41,968.00 $40,976.00 $100,070.00
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BID TABULATION FOR:

GALVESTON COUNTY MUNICIPAL UTILITY DISTRICT NO. 73

GALVESTON COUNTY, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

BID OPENING LOCATION: LJA ENGINEERING, INC.

TABULATION BY: C CORTEZ

TABULATION DATE: JUNE 05, 2026

LJA JOB NO. 0386-3119C (9.2)

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL UNIT COST TOTAL

1) FELLERS AND CLARK LP 2) R CONSTRUCTION CIVIL, LLC 3) DACO PAVING, INC. 4) HASSELL CONSTRUCTION GROUP LLC

CONSTRUCTION OF THE WATER, SANITARY SEWER, AND DRAINAGE FACILITIES 

& PAVING AND APPURTENANCES TO SERVE SAMARA ERVIN PHASE VI

BID SUMMARY

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS $264,326.75 $232,752.00 $223,299.00 $236,030.36

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $56,055.65 $46,950.00 $38,360.00 $53,007.74

BASE BID SAMARA WAY WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM ITEMS $36,083.15 $33,657.00 $30,627.00 $34,402.81

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI SANITARY SEWER TRUNK ITEMS $139,226.75 $125,505.00 $128,301.00 $176,396.45

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS $162,909.75 $142,964.00 $133,150.00 $140,253.00

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $15,802.90 $13,480.00 $12,688.00 $13,874.00

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI DRAINAGE FACILITY TRUNK ITEMS $343,383.95 $334,988.00 $304,721.00 $580,098.00

BASE BID SAMARA WAY DRAINAGE FACILITY ITEMS $24,759.55 $22,641.00 $22,377.00 $22,840.00

BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS WS&D ITEMS $31,227.90 $29,986.00 $53,021.50 $53,544.00

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $1,293,138.05 $1,403,839.00 $1,442,627.78 $1,469,833.50

BASE BID ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $241,361.50 $263,917.00 $269,804.05 $274,930.50

BASE BID SAMARA WAY PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $120,724.45 $134,255.00 $140,434.81 $136,572.00

BASE BID MISCELLANEOUS PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $144,999.65 $148,318.50 $200,588.86 $222,588.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $2,874,000.00 $2,933,252.50 $3,000,000.00 $3,414,370.36

ALTERNATE NO. 1

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID $2,874,000.00 $2,933,252.50 $3,000,000.00 $3,414,370.36

DEDUCT ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS ITEM NO. 1 -$945,228.15 -$1,009,546.00 -$1,009,546.00 -$1,058,395.00

DEDUCT ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL ITEM NO. 1 -$174,556.35 -$186,434.00 -$186,434.00 -$195,455.00

SLIP-FORM PAVING NO BID $1,119,552.00 $2,963,520.00 NO BID

ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS $198,369.30 $193,319.00 $196,858.00 $199,526.50

ADDITIONAL ERVIN STREET PHASE VI PAVING AND APPURTENANCES ITEMS - COMMERCIAL $41,609.90 $41,968.00 $40,976.00 $100,070.00

TOTAL ALTERNATE NO. 1 PLUS BASE BID NO BID $3,092,111.50 $5,005,374.00 NO BID
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